
                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 1 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 02/28/11 
                                                FOR THE LETTING OF January 12, 2011 
 
CONTRACT R -31761-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710986                                         DBE GOAL:  5.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: BIKE/PEDESTRIAN FACILITIES                          ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $     809,000.00 
CALL: 261                 ROUTE: SP BIKE                                             SEYMOUR DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON LESKO PARK TRAIL IN AURORA 
 
                         COUNTY: DEARBORN 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
31-1323837  | SUNESIS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY   | WEST CHESTER                 | $  1,153,392.79 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Ohio            513-326-6000 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1357381  | DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC      | NORTH VERNON                 | $    932,817.00 |R   | X |        AWARD * 
            |                                | Indiana         812-346-4135 |                 |    |   |        DBE  7.48% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1636776  | LINKEL COMPANY                 | BATESVILLE                   | $  1,665,804.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-934-5190 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00. 
 



                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 1 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 02/16/11 
                                                FOR THE LETTING OF January 12, 2011 
 
CONTRACT IR-29149-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0710627; 4654350                                DBE GOAL:  3.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: INTERCHANGE MODIFICATION AND NOISE ABATEMENT INSTAL ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $   8,866,600.00 
CALL: 131                 ROUTE: 465                                                 GREENFIELD DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON I-465 AT 170 (E. LEG) 
 
                         COUNTY: MARION 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1128289  | BEATY CONSTRUCTION INC         | BOGGSTOWN                    | $  7,440,898.80 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-835-2254 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1151771  | CALUMET CIVIL CONTRACTORS INC  | WHITESTOWN                   | $  7,176,376.88 |C   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-769-1900 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1618530  | AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE | JEFFERSONVILLE               | $  8,564,813.05 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-280-4404 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1917625  | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP       | COLUMBUS                     | $  6,688,000.00 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Indiana         800-854-1830 |                 |    |   |        DBE  3.13% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-4518443  | F H PASCHEN S N NIELSEN & ASSO | CHICAGO                      | $  7,656,917.11 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Illinois        773-444-3474 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
38-2932367  | RMD HOLDINGS LTD               | CHESTERFIELD                 | $  8,861,265.80 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Michigan        586-749-6900 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
38-3806996  | HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC           | INDIANAPOLIS                 | $  7,387,100.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-284-1195 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
 
 



                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 2 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 02/16/11 
                                                FOR THE LETTING OF January 12, 2011 
 
CONTRACT IR-33045-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500442                                         DBE GOAL:  6.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION                    ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $ 141,778,367.70 
CALL: 155                 ROUTE: 69                                                  VINCENNES DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON PR 69 FROM WHITE RIVER TO CSX RAILROAD 
 
                         COUNTY: DAVIESS      PIKE 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | PW OF FURUTE MAINTENANCE COST  |                              | $  6,234,874.21 |    |   | 
            | SEC 0001 HMA OPTION            |                              |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | PW OF FURUTE MAINTENANCE COST  |                              | $  3,919,178.39 |    |   | 
            | SEC 0002 PCCP OPTION           |                              |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | SEC 0004 ADMINISTRATIVE ITEMS  |                              | $          7.00 |    | X | 
            | FIXED PRICES                   |                              |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1875662  | CRIDER & CRIDER INC            | BLOOMINGTON                  |      NO BID     |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0001 HMA OPTION            | Indiana         812-336-4452 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1875662  | CRIDER & CRIDER INC            | BLOOMINGTON                  | $ 24,542,054.40 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0002 PCCP OPTION           | Indiana         812-336-4452 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1875662  | CRIDER & CRIDER INC            | BLOOMINGTON                  | $ 99,045,370.61 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0003 COMMON ITEM           | Indiana         812-336-4452 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1917625  | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP       | COLUMBUS                     |      NO BID     |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0001 HMA OPTION            | Indiana         800-854-1830 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1917625  | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP       | COLUMBUS                     | $ 24,188,987.57 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0002 PCCP OPTION           | Indiana         800-854-1830 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1917625  | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP       | COLUMBUS                     | $ 77,432,973.21 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0003 COMMON ITEM           | Indiana         800-854-1830 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-2040801  | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION | CLARKSVILLE                  |      NO BID     |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0001 HMA OPTION            | Indiana         812-282-1349 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-2040801  | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION | CLARKSVILLE                  | $ 26,360,989.65 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0002 PCCP OPTION           | Indiana         812-282-1349 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-2040801  | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION | CLARKSVILLE                  | $ 82,186,809.93 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0003 COMMON ITEM           | Indiana         812-282-1349 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 



                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 3 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 02/16/11 
                                                FOR THE LETTING OF January 12, 2011 
 
CONTRACT IR-33045-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500442                                         DBE GOAL:  6.00 
CONTINUED           DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION                    ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $ 141,778,367.70 
CALL: 155                 ROUTE: 69                                                  VINCENNES DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON PR 69 FROM WHITE RIVER TO CSX RAILROAD 
 
                         COUNTY: DAVIESS      PIKE 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-2231526  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY     | LAPORTE                      |      NO BID     |R   |   |         
            | SEC 0001 HMA OPTION            | Indiana         219-324-4320 |                 |    |   |         
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-2231526  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY     | LAPORTE                      | $ 23,591,617.04 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            | SEC 0002 PCCP OPTION           | Indiana         219-324-4320 |                 |    |   |         
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-2231526  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY     | LAPORTE                      | $ 75,215,629.02 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            | SEC 0003 COMMON ITEM           | Indiana         219-324-4320 |                 |    |   |(SEC 2+3+4 = $98,807,253.06)         
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
43-0626545  | FRED WEBER INC                 | MARYLAND HTS.                |      NO BID     |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0001 HMA OPTION            | Missouri        314-344-0070 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
43-0626545  | FRED WEBER INC                 | MARYLAND HTS.                | $ 26,297,594.68 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0002 PCCP OPTION           | Missouri        314-344-0070 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
43-0626545  | FRED WEBER INC                 | MARYLAND HTS.                | $ 79,427,349.63 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0003 COMMON ITEM           | Missouri        314-344-0070 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
99-9992098  | F H PASCHEN/T J LAMBRECHT J/V  | CHICAGO                      |      NO BID     |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0001 HMA OPTION            | Illinois        773-444-3474 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
99-9992098  | F H PASCHEN/T J LAMBRECHT J/V  | CHICAGO                      | $ 23,304,297.95 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0002 PCCP OPTION           | Illinois        773-444-3474 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
99-9992098  | F H PASCHEN/T J LAMBRECHT J/V  | CHICAGO                      | $ 79,928,401.64 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0003 COMMON ITEM           | Illinois        773-444-3474 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
99-9992455  | CHESTER BROSS CONSTR/KOLB GRAD | HANNIBAL                     |      NO BID     |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0001 HMA OPTION            | Missouri        573-221-5958 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
99-9992455  | CHESTER BROSS CONSTR/KOLB GRAD | HANNIBAL                     | $ 23,304,297.95 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0002 PCCP OPTION           | Missouri        573-221-5958 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
99-9992455  | CHESTER BROSS CONSTR/KOLB GRAD | HANNIBAL                     | $ 91,462,079.67 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0003 COMMON ITEM           | Missouri        573-221-5958 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
NOTE: THE RANK OF THE BIDDERS IS DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF A PAVEMENT OPTION SECTION (0001 OR 0002), THE APPROPRIATE PRESENT WORTH  
COST, AND THE COMMON ITEMS (SECTION 0003). A BID TOTAL IS THE SUM OF SECTION 0001 OR 0002, SECTION 0003, AND SECTION 0004. 
(AMOUNTS OF CONTRACTORS' SECTION BIDS SHOWN DO NOT INCLUDE SECTION 0004.) 



                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 4 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 02/16/11 
                                                FOR THE LETTING OF January 12, 2011 
 
CONTRACT IR-33095-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0400116, 1000013, 1000014                       DBE GOAL:  6.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: ROAD AND BRIDGE RECONSTRUCTION                      ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $   6,990,000.00 
CALL: 161                 ROUTE: 31                                                  GREENFIELD DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON US 31 FROM WESTERN WAY TO LOWES WAY 
 
                         COUNTY: HAMILTON 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION       | GOSHEN                       | $  6,708,917.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-875-5183 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1128289  | BEATY CONSTRUCTION INC         | BOGGSTOWN                    | $  6,347,757.31 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Indiana         317-835-2254 |                 |    |   |        DBE  7.20% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1151771  | CALUMET CIVIL CONTRACTORS INC  | WHITESTOWN                   | $  6,757,536.61 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-769-1900 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1609544  | SCHUTT-LOOKABILL CO            | INDIANAPOLIS                 | $  7,181,624.63 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-484-1500 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1917625  | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP       | COLUMBUS                     | $  6,978,700.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         800-854-1830 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
38-2675420  | ANLAAN CORPORATION             | SPRING LAKE                  | $  7,329,591.46 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Michigan        616-846-8442 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
 
 



                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 5 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 02/16/11 
                                                FOR THE LETTING OF January 12, 2011 
 
CONTRACT T -32238-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0900108                                         DBE GOAL:  0.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: INSTALL NEW GUARDRAIL                               ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $     563,000.00 
CALL: 721                 ROUTE: I-74                                                CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ALONG I-74 AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS 
 
                         COUNTY: MONTGOMERY 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
04-3815584  | GFS FENCE GUARDRAIL & SIGNAGE  | HUNTLEY                      | $    549,539.94 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Illinois        224-654-2122 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0821499  | JAMES H DREW CORPORATION       | INDIANAPOLIS                 | $    419,787.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-876-3739 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1643252  | C-TECH CORPORATION INC         | BOGGSTOWN                    | $    478,470.75 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-835-2745 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-2110733  | SPECIALTIES COMPANY LLC AND SU | INDIANAPOLIS                 | $    547,953.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-594-0291 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
38-2421492  | ACTION TRAFFIC MAINTENANCE     | FLINT                        | $    571,509.50 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Michigan        810-695-7516 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
38-2677797  | J RANCK ELECTRIC INC           | MT PLEASANT                  | $    463,481.25 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Michigan        800-792-3822 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
38-2932367  | RMD HOLDINGS LTD               | CHESTERFIELD                 | $    462,773.60 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Michigan        586-749-6900 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
43-1012298  | COLLINS & HERMANN INC          | ST LOUIS                     | $    505,624.28 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Missouri        314-869-8000 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
61-0600430  | GEORGE B STONE CO LLC          | SHARPSBURG                   | $    414,236.00 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Kentucky        606-247-3461 |                 |    |   |         
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
 
 



                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 6 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 02/16/11 
                                                FOR THE LETTING OF January 12, 2011 
 
CONTRACT T -32239-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0900109                                         DBE GOAL:  0.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: NEW GUARDRAIL                                       ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $     881,000.00 
CALL: 731                 ROUTE: 65                                                  CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ALONG I-65 AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS 
 
                         COUNTY: CLINTON      JASPER 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
04-3815584  | GFS FENCE GUARDRAIL & SIGNAGE  | HUNTLEY                      | $    810,993.74 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Illinois        224-654-2122 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0821499  | JAMES H DREW CORPORATION       | INDIANAPOLIS                 | $    634,888.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-876-3739 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1643252  | C-TECH CORPORATION INC         | BOGGSTOWN                    | $    738,442.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-835-2745 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-2110733  | SPECIALTIES COMPANY LLC AND SU | INDIANAPOLIS                 | $    827,289.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-594-0291 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
38-2421492  | ACTION TRAFFIC MAINTENANCE     | FLINT                        | $    779,602.10 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Michigan        810-695-7516 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
38-2677797  | J RANCK ELECTRIC INC           | MT PLEASANT                  | $    659,950.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Michigan        800-792-3822 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
38-2932367  | RMD HOLDINGS LTD               | CHESTERFIELD                 | $    686,950.05 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Michigan        586-749-6900 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
38-2954313  | FUTURE FENCE COMPANY           | WARREN                       | $    704,006.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Michigan        586-755-0900 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
43-1012298  | COLLINS & HERMANN INC          | ST LOUIS                     | $    764,686.88 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Missouri        314-869-8000 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
61-0600430  | GEORGE B STONE CO LLC          | SHARPSBURG                   | $    613,979.00 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Kentucky        606-247-3461 |                 |    |   |         
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 



                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 1 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 02/14/11 
                                                FOR THE LETTING OF January 12, 2011 
 
CONTRACT R -31290-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0501163, 1005621                                DBE GOAL:  6.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION                                 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $   5,930,000.00 
CALL: 251                 ROUTE:                                                     CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON PERIMETER PARKWAY FROM MARTIN C JISCHKE DRIVE TO 
                                 SHEETZ STREET PURDUE UNIVERSITY 
                         COUNTY: TIPPECANOE 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION       | GOSHEN                       | $  5,659,539.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-875-5183 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1875662  | CRIDER & CRIDER INC            | BLOOMINGTON                  | $  5,047,553.12 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-336-4452 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1917625  | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP       | COLUMBUS                     | $  4,856,831.03 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Indiana         800-854-1830 |                 |    |   |        DBE  6.07% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
 
 



                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 2 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 02/14/11 
                                                FOR THE LETTING OF January 12, 2011 
 
CONTRACT R -33075-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0810293                                         DBE GOAL:  7.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENT                            ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $   1,350,000.00 
CALL: 301                 ROUTE:                                                     LAPORTE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON AIRPORT ROAD AT PORTAGE HIGH SCHOOL 
 
                         COUNTY: PORTER 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION       | GOSHEN                       | $  1,510,056.53 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-875-5183 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1058916  | WOODRUFF & SONS INC            | MICHIGAN CITY                | $  1,432,271.63 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-872-8605 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1068009  | DYER CONSTRUCTION CO           | DYER                         | $  1,224,711.69 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-865-2961 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1120685  | WALSH & KELLY INC              | GRIFFITH                     | $  1,155,816.77 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Indiana         219-924-5900 |                 |    |   |        DBE  7.06% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1569222  | GRIMMER CONSTRUCTION INC       | HIGHLAND                     | $  1,382,948.46 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-924-1623 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
 



                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 1 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 01/26/11 
                                                FOR THE LETTING OF January 12, 2011 
 
CONTRACT R -30324-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 2063004                                         DBE GOAL:  4.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: INTERSECTION IMPROVEMENT                            ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $   2,185,700.00 
CALL: 205                 ROUTE: 2                                                   LAPORTE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON SR 2 AT FORRESTER ROAD, 4.86 MILES WEST OF SR 39 
 
                         COUNTY: LAPORTE 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION       | GOSHEN                       | $  1,536,749.21 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-875-5183 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0997978  | PHEND & BROWN INC              | MILFORD                      | $  1,845,950.53 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-658-4166 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1058916  | WOODRUFF & SONS INC            | MICHIGAN CITY                | $  1,870,071.09 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-872-8605 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1068009  | DYER CONSTRUCTION CO           | DYER                         | $  1,576,478.81 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-865-2961 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1120685  | WALSH & KELLY INC              | GRIFFITH                     | $  1,444,056.31 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Indiana         219-924-5900 |                 |    |   |        DBE  4.02% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1487677  | G E MARSHALL INC               | VALPARAISO                   | $  1,575,394.98 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-462-3415 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1489621  | HRP CONSTRUCTION INC           | SOUTH BEND                   | $  1,780,718.05 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-271-7800 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
 



                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 2 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 01/26/11 
                                                FOR THE LETTING OF January 12, 2011 
 
CONTRACT R -30764-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0900152; 0711018                                DBE GOAL:  3.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION                        ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $   5,731,700.00 
CALL: 231                 ROUTE: 23                                                  LAPORTE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON SR 23 AT KOONTZ LAKE DAM 
 
                         COUNTY: STARKE 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
26-3919039  | TONN AND BLANK CONSTRUCTION LL | MICHIGAN CITY                | $  5,374,382.01 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-879-7321 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION       | GOSHEN                       | $  5,387,000.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-875-5183 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1035122  | GARIUP CONSTRUCTION CO INC     | GARY                         | $  5,878,900.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-887-5233 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1068009  | DYER CONSTRUCTION CO           | DYER                         | $  5,248,669.45 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-865-2961 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1690004  | NORTHERN INDIANA CONSTRUCTION  | MISHAWAKA                    | $  4,646,759.03 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Indiana         574-256-1811 |                 |    |   |        DBE  3.25% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
38-2675420  | ANLAAN CORPORATION             | SPRING LAKE                  | $  4,987,187.87 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Michigan        616-846-8442 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
 



                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 3 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 01/26/11 
                                                FOR THE LETTING OF January 12, 2011 
 
CONTRACT R -32732-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0400531; 0400433                                DBE GOAL:  0.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: PIPE LINING                                         ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $     916,050.00 
CALL: 265                 ROUTE: 30                                                  LAPORTE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON US 30, 1.10 MILES WEST OF SR 17 AND 0.19 MILE 
                                 WEST OF SR 331 
                         COUNTY: MARSHALL 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1004746  | TEMPLE & TEMPLE EXCAVATING & P | SALEM                        | $    373,286.00 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Indiana         812-883-6644 |                 |    |   |         
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1526557  | MIDWEST MOLE INC               | INDIANAPOLIS                 | $    450,207.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-545-1335 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1817574  | YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE            | ANDERSON                     | $    436,691.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         765-378-5783 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-2097364  | INDIANA RELINE INC             | SULPHURSPRINGS               | $    392,348.70 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         765-533-5040 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
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CONTRACT RS-30076-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500281                                         DBE GOAL:  5.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE                                   ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $   1,835,000.00 
CALL: 401                 ROUTE: 421                                                 LAPORTE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON US 421 FROM SR 114 TO SR 14 
 
                         COUNTY: PULASKI 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION       | GOSHEN                       | $  1,454,881.44 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-875-5183 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0997978  | PHEND & BROWN INC              | MILFORD                      | $  1,388,800.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-658-4166 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1120685  | WALSH & KELLY INC              | GRIFFITH                     | $  1,195,892.85 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Indiana         219-924-5900 |                 |    |   |        DBE  5.00% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1139301  | E & B PAVING INC               | ANDERSON                     | $  1,243,764.50 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         765-643-5358 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1621699  | CENTRAL PAVING INC             | LOGANSPORT                   | $  1,644,723.87 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-722-4727 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
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CONTRACT RS-33361-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005841                                         DBE GOAL:  2.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: SURFACE TREATMENT, MICROSURFACE                     ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $     717,100.00 
CALL: 461                 ROUTE: 421                                                 LAPORTE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON US 421 FROM US 24 TO SR 16 (BROADWAY STREET) 
 
                         COUNTY: WHITE 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
26-2688853  | STRAWSER CONSTRUCTION INC      | COLUMBUS                     | $    767,407.16 |R   | X |        AWARD * 
            |                                | Ohio            614-276-5501 |                 |    |   |        DBE  2.57% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
26-2885272  | PAVEMENT MAINTENANCE SYSTEMS L | INDIANAPOLIS                 | $    839,308.08 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-228-8370 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1004746  | TEMPLE & TEMPLE EXCAVATING & P | SALEM                        | $    903,555.08 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-883-6644 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
43-1878237  | MICRO SURFACING INC            | ST LOUIS                     | $    796,598.85 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Missouri        314-989-9001 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN $1,000,000.00. 
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CONTRACT RS-33362-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005894                                         DBE GOAL:  4.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE                                   ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $     823,000.00 
CALL: 471                 ROUTE: US 24                                               LAPORTE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON US 24 FROM US 231 TO US 421 
 
                         COUNTY: WHITE 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION       | GOSHEN                       | $    723,061.53 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Indiana         574-875-5183 |                 |    |   |        DBE  4.03% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1621699  | CENTRAL PAVING INC             | LOGANSPORT                   | $    764,185.23 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-722-4727 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1917625  | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP       | COLUMBUS                     | $    884,355.20 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         800-854-1830 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
 



                                                INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION                                  PAGE: 7 
                                                OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED                                  DATE: 01/26/11 
                                                FOR THE LETTING OF January 12, 2011 
 
CONTRACT RS-33363-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005896                                         DBE GOAL:  0.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: SURFACE TREATMENT, MICROSURFACE                     ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $   1,070,000.00 
CALL: 481                 ROUTE: 24                                                  LAPORTE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON US 24 FROM ILLINOIS STATE LINE TO EAST JUNCTION OF SR 55 
 
                         COUNTY: NEWTON 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
26-2688853  | STRAWSER CONSTRUCTION INC      | COLUMBUS                     | $  1,041,396.86 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Ohio            614-276-5501 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
26-2885272  | PAVEMENT MAINTENANCE SYSTEMS L | INDIANAPOLIS                 | $  1,081,354.92 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         317-228-8370 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
43-1878237  | MICRO SURFACING INC            | ST LOUIS                     | $    995,274.59 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Missouri        314-989-9001 |                 |    |   |         
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
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CONTRACT B -32758-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005481                                         DBE GOAL:  0.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR                       ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $     271,425.00 
CALL: 581                 ROUTE: 4                                                   LAPORTE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON SR 4 OVER FISH LAKE CHANNEL AND OVER HICKUM DITCH 
                                 1.17 MILES WEST OF SR 49 
                         COUNTY: LAPORTE 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
26-3919039  | TONN AND BLANK CONSTRUCTION LL | MICHIGAN CITY                | $    328,750.14 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-879-7321 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
32-0154474  | JCI BRIDGE GROUP INC           | LAPORTE                      | $    220,846.82 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Indiana         219-324-9393 |                 |    |   |         
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0461550  | LARSON DANIELSON CONSTRUCTION  | LAPORTE                      | $    254,608.39 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-362-2127 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1035122  | GARIUP CONSTRUCTION CO INC     | GARY                         | $    279,900.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-887-5233 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1523985  | WIRTZ & YATES INC              | KENTLAND                     | $    346,741.20 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-474-6542 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1817530  | PIONEER ASSOCIATES INC         | LEO                          | $    275,315.72 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         260-627-5981 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-0872360  | ALBIN CARLSON & CO             | ADDISON                      | $    349,777.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Illinois        630-785-4000 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
 
 


